

**CITY OF WAUKESHA PARKS, RECREATION AND FORESTRY DEPARTMENT**

**Buchner Pool Furniture Acquisition**

**BIDS CLOSE: Friday, February 12, 2021 AT 12:00 PM**

Supplier	Pool Furniture Supply	Master Z's	Lincoln Aquatics	Staples
	Charlene Parks	Rob Kahler	Connie Johnson	Terry Montville
	2729 East Moody BLVD Suite	1923 W. Bluemound Rd	2021 Commerce Ave	1901 Summit Tower Blvd.
<b>Contact Information</b>	203, Bunell, FL 32110	Brookfield, WI 53045	Concord, CA 94520	Orlando, FL 32810
<b>180 Lounges/20 Chairs</b>	\$ 45,122.00	\$ 49,255.00	\$ 49,325.00	\$ 43,639.00
<b>202 Lounges/23 Chairs</b>	\$ 50,707.00	\$ 54,453.00	\$ 55,080.00	\$ 49,040.00
<b>225 Lounges/25 Chairs</b>	\$ 55,785.00	\$ 59,554.00	\$ 60,955.00	\$ 54,549.00
<b>248 Lounges/27 Chairs</b>	\$ 60,015.00	\$ 64,784.00	\$ 66,830.00	\$ 60,057.00
<b>270 Lounges/30 Chairs</b>	\$ 64,569.00	\$ 69,709.00	\$ 72,965.00	\$ 65,459.00
<b>3 - 39" tables - Bar Height</b>	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 2,359.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>12 - Bermuda Dining Chair Bar Height</b>	\$ 3,042.00	\$ 3,213.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>20 - 39" tables - Dining height</b>	\$ 10,390.00	\$ 13,977.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>80- Bermuda Dining Stacking Chair</b>	\$ 12,324.00	\$ 14,964.00	No Bid	No bid
<b>2 - Wausau Tile TF1040 Receptacle</b>	\$ 1,030.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,079.00
<b>15 - Witt Industries WTAL35 Receptacle</b>	\$ 6,816.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6,623.00
<b>5 - Witt industries WTAL35 recycler</b>	\$ 2,272.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,234.00
<b>6 - LL-MS-TB-RD Receptacle</b>	\$ 3,569.00	No Bid	\$ 3,540.00	No Bid
<b>All items in lines 10-17</b>	<b>AND</b>			
<b>248 lounges/27 chairs</b>	\$ 101,184.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Place order by 2/18 with Pool Supply	\$ (2,280.00)			
	\$ 98,904.66			