LAWNDALE AVENUE, FAIRMONT AVENUE AND CALDWELL STREET UTILLITY AND STREET IMPROVEMENTS - ALTERNATE

Alternate not recommended.

Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5
Bids Received: January 15, 2021 at 11:00 a.m. Advance Construction, Inc. A.W. Oakes & Son, Inc. LaLonde Contractors, Inc. State Contractors, Inc. UPI, LLC
2141 Woodale Avenue 2000 Oakes Road 1609 Lincoln Avenue 16575 W. Dakota Street 2180 S. Springdale Road
Green Bay, W1 54313 Racine, W1 53406 Waukesha, WI 53186 New Berlin, Wl 53151 New Berlin, WI 53146
Line ltem No ltem Descriotion Unit Approx. Unit Bid Amount Unit Bid Amount Unit Bid Amount Unit Bid Amount Unit Bid Amount
No. ' P Quantities Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid
TOTAL $ 997,205.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 01001 TRAFFIC CONTROL LS 1 39400 $ 39,400.00
2 02003 EROSION BALES EACH 20 15 $ 300.00
3 02005 INLET PROTECTION EACH 5 75 $ 375.00
4 03300 REMOVE EXISTING CURB AND GUTTER LF 3100 4 $ 12,400.00
5 03331 REMOVE EXISTING SIDEWALK SF 9000 1 $ 9,000.00
6 03500 SAWCUTTING AT PAVEMENT LIMITS LF 150 2.5 $ 375.00
7 03650 REMOVE EXISTING ROADWAY SY 4100 19 $ 77,900.00
8 04010 SHAPING AND GRADING TO SUBGRADE LF 1650 11 $ 18,150.00
9 04015 GEOTEXTILE FABRIC TYPE SAS NON- SY 2000 2 $ 4,000.00
WOVEN
10 04016 GEOTEXTILE GRID TYPE BX1100 SY 1000 2.25 $ 2,250.00
11 04020 1-1/4" CRUSHED STONE ROADWAY BASE TON 3800 14.25 $ 54,150.00
12 04990 CRUSHED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE, 3" TON 1500 18| $ 27,000.00
(INCLUDES EBS)
13 05005 4-INCH PERFORATED UNDERDRAIN LF 100 40| $ 4,000.00
14 0 INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 0 0 $ -
15 05050 INTERNAL CHIMNEY SEAL EACH 8 560| $ 4,480.00
16 05056 SANITARY LATERAL CLEANOUT EACH 17 1700| $ 28,900.00
17 05074 SANITARY LATERAL CLEANING AND EACH 17 330 $ 5,610.00
PRELINING VIDEO INSPECTION
18 05075 SANITARY SEWER SPOT REPAIR EACH 4 4570( $ 18,280.00
19 05076 SANITARY SEWER LATERAL SPOT REPAIR EACH 2 3570( $ 7,140.00
20 05080 SANITARY LATERAL REINSTATEMENT EACH 20 10( $ 200.00
21 05308 8 INCH CIPP SANITARY SEWER PIPE LF 1185 235| % 27,847.50
22 05350 SANITARY LATERAL LINING (CIPP) WITHIN EACH 17 2860( $ 48,620.00
25 FT. OF SEWER MAIN
23 05351 SANITARY LATERAL LINING (CIPP) LF 135 35 % 4,725.00
ADDITIONAL LENGTH OVER 25 FT. FROM
SEWER
24 05401 48 INCH DIA SANITARY MANHOLE EACH 4 4525| $ 18,100.00
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25 05410 REHABILITATE SANITARY MANHOLE W/ EACH 1 1990 $ 1,990.00

CEMENTITIOUS LINER
26 05420 SANITARY MANHOLE BENCH / INVERT / EACH 1 1000| $ 1,000.00

TROUGH WORK - MINOR
27 05432 REPLACE SANITARY SEWER CHIMNEY, EACH 4 1000| $ 4,000.00

FRAME & COVER
28 05485 2'X3' STORM INLET EACH 2 2440( $ 4,880.00
29 05542 12 INCH RCP STORM SEWER PIPE LF 30 74 $ 2,220.00
30 05680 STORM SEWER INLET REPAIR VF 10 1500 $ 15,000.00
31 05692 STORM SEWER MANHOLE REPAIR VF 10 1000| $ 10,000.00
32 05695 STORM MANHOLE CHIMNEY EACH 1 1000( $ 1,000.00

REPLACEMENT, AND FRAME AND COVER
33 05951 SANITARY SEWER CLEANING AND LF 1185 1.75( $ 2,073.75

TELEVISING
34 05952 SANITARY SEWER LATERAL TELEVISING EACH 40 167| $ 6,680.00
35 05955 STORM SEWER CLEANING AND TELEVISING LF 60 2| $ 120.00
36 06100 EXTRA BAGS OF CEMENT EA 50 20| $ 1,000.00
37 06500 TYPE A SLURRY CYy 50 100( $ 5,000.00
38 07002 CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER REMOVAL & LF 100 74| $ 7,400.00

REPLACEMENT
39 07008 INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 0 0 $ -
40 07130 30" TYPE A CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER LF 1200 20| $ 24,000.00
41 07301 CURB RAMP DETECTABLE WARNING SF 160 40( $ 6,400.00

FIELDS
42 07302 PEDESTRIAN CURB LF 100 27| $ 2,700.00
43 07304 4-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF 4400 6.7 $ 29,480.00
44 07306 6-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK & DRIVE SF 3400 8.25| $ 28,050.00
45 07307 7-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK & DRIVE SF 1200 86| $ 10,320.00
46 07990 30" TYPE TBT CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER LF 1950 20| $ 39,000.00
47 08012 MILL EXISTING ASPHALT ROADWAY - 2" SY 350 13.69| $ 4,791.50
48 08020 FOUNDATION PREPARATION OF MILLED SY 350 35 % 1,225.00

PAVEMENT
49 08065 HMA PAVEMENT PATCHING SY 20 125| $ 2,500.00
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50 08203 HMA PAVEMENT TYPE 3LT5828S TON 750 60| $ 45,000.00
51 08205 HMA PAVEMENT TYPE 5LT5828S TON 550 68| $ 37,400.00
52 13001 REMOVE SIGNS AND POSTS EACH 30 46| $ 1,380.00
53 14003 TOPSOIL, FERTILIZER, SEED & EROSION SY 100 55( % 550.00

MAT
54 14005 TOPSOIL & SOD SY 1600 71 % 11,200.00
55 15001 FURNISH AND INSTALL 8" WATER MAIN AND LF 1,640 110 $ 180,400.00

FITTINGS
56 15002 FURNISH AND INSTALL 8" GATE VALVES & EA 6 1670 $ 10,020.00

BOX
57 15003 FURNISH AND INSTALL HYDRANT EA 3 6100| $ 18,300.00

ASSEMBLY
58 15004 CONNECT SERVICE LATERAL (SL1) EA 1 1405| $ 1,405.00
59 15005 CONNECT SERVICE LATERAL (SL2) EA 5 1950( $ 9,750.00
60 15006 CONNECT SERVICE LATERAL (SL3) EA 1 1950| $ 1,950.00
61 15007 CONNECT SERVICE LATERAL (SL4) EA 1 2075( $ 2,075.00
62 15008 CONNECT SERVICE LATERAL (SL5) EA 1 1693| $ 1,693.00
63 15009 CONNECT SERVICE LATERAL (SL6) EA 10 3035 $ 30,350.00
64 15010 CONNECT SERVICE LATERAL (SL7) EA 3 3050( $ 9,150.00
65 15011 CONNECT SERVICE LATERAL (SL8) EA 1 3000| $ 3,000.00
66 15012 ABANDON EXISTING HYDRANTS EA 1 750| $ 750.00
67 15013 ABANDON VALVE BOXES & MANHOLES LS 1 1000| $ 1,000.00
68 04991 SHAPING AND GRADING TO SUBGRADE SY 350 10 $ 3,500.00

(FINE GRADING)
69 08204 HMA PAVEMENT TYPE 4LT5828S TON 20 215| $ 4,300.00

***The City reserves the right to increase or delete quantities to make the bid most advantageous to the City
and or reject any or all bids.
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