
From: Ryan Fisk
To: Jonathan Schapekahm
Cc: Judith Allen; Melissa Lipska
Subject: RE: September Readings
Date: Thursday, September 30, 2021 10:00:02 AM
Attachments: Pool Data.docx

Hi Jon,
Please have the credit applied to 5325.52230.  I have also attached the pool data sheets that show gallons of each
body of water.  Please let me know if anything else is needed, and thanks for processing this.
Ryan

-----Original Message-----
From: Jonathan Schapekahm <JSchapekahm@waukesha-wi.gov>
Sent: Thursday, September 30, 2021 9:46 AM
To: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Cc: Judith Allen <JAllen@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Hi Ryan-

Thanks for the call earlier to understand exactly what occurred.  Could you let us know to what account the credit
should be directed?

Thanks.

Jonathan Schapekahm, P.E.
Project Engineer / CMOM Coordinator
City of Waukesha
Phone: 262-524-3584
Email: jschapekahm@waukesha-wi.gov

201 Delafield St., Waukesha, WI 53188
https://waukesha-wi.gov/

        

-----Original Message-----
From: Jonathan Schapekahm
Sent: Wednesday, September 29, 2021 4:16 PM
To: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Hi Ryan-

Sorry I missed your call earlier as I was in a meeting.  Just tried calling you and it rang and then just seemed to do
nothing - no way to leave a message.  Give me a call when you have a chance to discuss.  I should be around except
for a meeting I have tomorrow at 10am.

Thanks.

Jonathan Schapekahm, P.E.

mailto:rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov
mailto:JSchapekahm@waukesha-wi.gov
mailto:JAllen@waukesha-wi.gov
mailto:mlipska@waukesha-wi.gov
https://waukesha-wi.gov/
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Project Engineer / CMOM Coordinator
City of Waukesha
Phone: 262-524-3584
Email: jschapekahm@waukesha-wi.gov

201 Delafield St., Waukesha, WI 53188
https://waukesha-wi.gov/

        

-----Original Message-----
From: Alex Damien <ADamien@waukesha-wi.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 1:07 PM
To: Jonathan Schapekahm <JSchapekahm@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: FW: September Readings

Hey Jon,
Can you work on this.
Thanks
Alex

-----Original Message-----
From: Tim Young
Sent: Friday, September 24, 2021 2:03 PM
To: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Cc: Mark Thompson <MThompson@waukesha-wi.gov>; Mary Berg <mberg@waukesha-wi.gov>; Tina L. Kadrich
<TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>; Jeff Harenda <JHarenda@waukesha-wi.gov>; Melissa Lipska
<mlipska@waukesha-wi.gov>; Alex Damien <ADamien@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Ryan- please contact Alex Damien if you would like to request a one-time sewer credit.  He can fill you in on the
process for doing that.  And continue to report the monthly readings from your credit meter to Tina, even if there is
no usage.  Thanks-

Tim Young
Pretreatment Coordinator
City of Waukesha Clean Water Plant
O:  262-524-3628
C:  414-507-1135
tyoung@waukesha-wi.gov
www.waukesha-wi.gov

          

-----Original Message-----
From: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2021 3:16 PM
To: Tim Young <TYOUNG@waukesha-wi.gov>
Cc: Mark Thompson <MThompson@waukesha-wi.gov>; Mary Berg <mberg@waukesha-wi.gov>; Tina L. Kadrich
<TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>; Jeff Harenda <JHarenda@waukesha-wi.gov>; Melissa Lipska
<mlipska@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: RE: September Readings

https://waukesha-wi.gov/


Hi Tim,
We are kind of in a pickle here, because we specified a credit meter to the contracted builder.  His plumbing sub
talked to someone at Water Utility who told him that credit meters were no longer allowed.  We didn’t find out this
information until the pool was filled and most of the season was in the books.  Some of the fill water did go through
a meter that was off a hydrant(per Tina-275,900 gallons), but the remainder (118,053 gallons) went through the
building meter. At the end of the day, we are not asking for anything besides the fill difference to be a one-time
credit.  There is a significant amount of evaporation and loss from bathers, which we are not looking to speculate
usage on.  Please let me know your thoughts and if you have any questions.
Thanks
Ryan

-----Original Message-----
From: Tim Young <TYOUNG@waukesha-wi.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2021 8:06 AM
To: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Cc: Mark Thompson <MThompson@waukesha-wi.gov>; Mary Berg <mberg@waukesha-wi.gov>; Tina L. Kadrich
<TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>; Jeff Harenda <JHarenda@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Hi Ryan- the pool filling water would also have to be metered and certified if you want to receive sewer credit.

Tim Young
Pretreatment Coordinator
City of Waukesha Clean Water Plant
O:  262-524-3628
C:  414-507-1135
tyoung@waukesha-wi.gov
www.waukesha-wi.gov

          

-----Original Message-----
From: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, September 15, 2021 12:51 PM
To: Tina L. Kadrich <TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>
Cc: Mark Thompson <MThompson@waukesha-wi.gov>; Mary Berg <mberg@waukesha-wi.gov>; Tim Young
<TYOUNG@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Thanks Tina,

Tim, this would be the water that is tested and discharged to storm.
Thanks
Ryan

-----Original Message-----
From: Tina L. Kadrich <TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 15, 2021 12:39 PM
To: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Cc: Mark Thompson <MThompson@waukesha-wi.gov>; Mary Berg <mberg@waukesha-wi.gov>; Tim Young
<TYOUNG@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Hi Ryan,



I think this is a question for Tim Young since it's the sewer revenue.  Tim is off until Friday so hopefully he an look
into this on Monday.

Thanks!

Tina
Tina Kadrich
Customer Service & Billing Supervisor
Waukesha Water Utility
P O Box 1648
Waukesha, WI  53187-1648
Phn (262) 409-4427
Fax (262) 521-5265
Tkadrich@waukesha-water.com

   Using Great Lakes Water the Right Way Great Water Alliance works to create a safe and sustainable supply of
clean drinking water for Waukesha.

-----Original Message-----
From: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, September 15, 2021 12:17 PM
To: Tina L. Kadrich <TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>
Cc: Mark Thompson <MThompson@waukesha-wi.gov>; Mary Berg <mberg@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Hi Tina,
With the credit meter installed/certified at Buchner, would we be eligible for a credit on the water used to fill the
pool bodies?  I have attached gallons below if needed.
Thanks
Ryan

Buchner Pool- Lap-362,836   Plunge-14,661   Wading-16,456

-----Original Message-----
From: Tina L. Kadrich <TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 3:51 PM
To: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Cc: Tim Young <TYOUNG@waukesha-wi.gov>; Katherine Andersen <kandersen@waukesha-water.com>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Hi Ryan,

Tim would like to be at the appointment and I think he said he's on vacation maybe next week?   Could we do it
tomorrow at 10:30?

Tina
Tina Kadrich
Customer Service & Billing Supervisor
Waukesha Water Utility
P O Box 1648
Waukesha, WI  53187-1648
Phn (262) 409-4427
Fax (262) 521-5265
Tkadrich@waukesha-water.com



   Using Great Lakes Water the Right Way Great Water Alliance works to create a safe and sustainable supply of
clean drinking water for Waukesha.

-----Original Message-----
From: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 3:47 PM
To: Tina L. Kadrich <TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>
Subject: RE: September Readings

Thanks Tina, the credit meter at Buchner Pool was just installed and ready for inspection. 
Thanks
Ryan

-----Original Message-----
From: Tina L. Kadrich <TKadrich@waukesha-water.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 3:37 PM
To: Ryan Fisk <rfisk@waukesha-wi.gov>
Subject: September Readings

Hi Ryan,

Please update, thank you!

Tina
Tina Kadrich
Customer Service & Billing Supervisor
Waukesha Water Utility
P O Box 1648
Waukesha, WI  53187-1648
Phn (262) 409-4427
Fax (262) 521-5265
Tkadrich@waukesha-water.com


